
BID RESULTS 
 

Fifth Street Improvements, Fairbank, Iowa #091121.MS 
 

 Contractor, City Water System + 5th St.
+ Alternate A 

Water System +  
Water Option+ 

5th Street + Alternate A 

Water System + 5th 
St.+ Alternate B 

Water System +  
Water Option+ 

5th Street + Alternate B 
1 Baker Enterprises, Waverly, IA $236,018.11 $257,011.53 $228,854.88 $249,848.30 
2 K. Cunningham Const. Co, Inc., Cedar Falls, IA $243,623.01 $265,238.93 NO BID NO BID 

3 Skyline Const., Inc., Decorah, IA $244,830.53 $264,700.08 $227,175.52 $247,045.07 

4 Tschiggfrie Excavating, Dubuque, IA $245,967.40 $268,353.57 $262,499.62 $284,885.79 

5 Concrete Foundations Inc., New Hampton, IA $255,972.56 $278,520.46 NO BID NO BID 

6 Eastern Iowa Excavating, Cascade, IA $266,847.47 $288,086.47 $248,869.57 $270,108.57 
7 Allied Const. Co., Inc., Charles City, IA $282,289.53 $304,220.43 NO BID NO BID 
8 Vieth Const., Corp., Cedar Falls, IA $290,273.53 $317,879.43 $266,150.45 $293,756.35 

 
No action taken. 

 
A complete bid tabulation will be mailed to all plan holders. 

 


